Freedom of Information - Humberside Fire and Rescue Service 
2022/01 Deliberate Fires

The request is:

1. How many deliberate fires have been recorded for the years: 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022?

2. How many fires have been flagged as a result of anti-social behaviour for the years: 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022?

3. How many fires have been flagged as a result of anti-social behaviour for the years for the last four years broken down by quarter? i.e:
 
2018/19 Apr, May, Jun
2018/19 Jul, Aug, Sep
2018/19 Oct, Nov, Dec
2018/19 Jan, Feb, Mar
  
2020/21 Apr, May, Jun
2020/21 Jul, Aug, Sep
2020/21 Oct, Nov, Dec
2020/21 Jan, Feb, Mar
 
2021/22 Apr, May, Jun
2021/22 Jul, Aug, Sep
2021/22 Oct, Nov, Dec
2021/22 Jan, Feb, Mar


The response is:

Please find attached spreadsheet providing details of deliberate fires recorded during the time frames stated in part 1. of your request.
 
We regret being unable to provide any information relating to parts 2. and 3. as this information is not held. We currently do not record data/details on whether fires occur due to anti-social behaviour.
 
Our results included incidents within Humberside Fire & Rescue Service area, which were recorded as Fire, Deliberate, Primary fires – i.e., dwelling fires, commercial property fires, vehicles fires and other property categorised as “property of value”, such as sheds, and Secondary fires – i.e., rubbish fires, wheelie bins, derelict buildings/vehicles, vegetation etc.
 
We hope this information is of assistance.




		  
If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal review. A request for an internal review should be made within 40 working days of the date of this email. If you are not happy with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply direct to the Information Commissioner. The address is: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.
https://ico.org.uk/
 
 




FOI 001 deliberate fires.xlsx
Sheet1

		Year/Month		FIRE PRIMARY		FIRE SECONDARY

		2018/19		572		2264

		18/04		34		136

		18/05		47		194

		18/06		52		241

		18/07		59		380

		18/08		67		300

		18/09		55		200

		18/10		45		160

		18/11		44		184

		18/12		34		58

		19/01		49		121

		19/02		48		142

		19/03		38		148

		2019/20		519		2032

		19/04		44		287

		19/05		51		222

		19/06		47		142

		19/07		54		246

		19/08		52		222

		19/09		44		264

		19/10		35		140

		19/11		29		121

		19/12		35		83

		20/01		45		81

		20/02		35		107

		20/03		48		117

		2020/21		351		1576

		20/04		27		111

		20/05		23		165

		20/06		33		122

		20/07		30		145

		20/08		27		129

		20/09		39		206

		20/10		39		132

		20/11		30		166

		20/12		22		76

		21/01		23		72

		21/02		25		72

		21/03		33		180

		2021/22		421		2169

		21/04		39		337

		21/05		39		142

		21/06		24		171

		21/07		25		119

		21/08		45		185

		21/09		60		237

		21/10		49		208

		21/11		28		260

		21/12		33		79

		22/01		28		133

		22/02		21		120

		22/03		30		178
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